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School Values: A culture of achievement where all can succeed. 

Through our PSHE curriculum, we endeavour to promote our school values which are: 

At Guildford Grove, we  

• are responsible and respectful members of our diverse community 

• are empowered to make safe, informed choices  

• have high aspirations and a “can do” attitude to learning and we 

• develop and foster our individual abilities and interests. 
 

 

1. Intent statement 

At Guildford Grove Primary School, we have always valued the importance of prioritising 

PSHE across the school. We intend to deliver a bespoke PSHE curriculum which will be a 

planned programme of learning opportunities and experiences that help children and young 

people grow and develop as individuals and as members of their families and their diverse 

communities.  It provides them with the knowledge, understanding and practical skills to 

live healthy, safe, fulfilled and responsible lives.   

 

2. Aims 

PSHE is a planned programme of learning opportunities and experiences that help children 
and young people grow and develop as individuals and members of families and 
communities. It equips them with knowledge, understanding and practical skills to live 
healthy, safe, fulfilled and responsible lives. The aims of personal, social, health and 
economic (PSHE) education in our school are to develop: 

• Physical health and wellbeing 



• Mental health and emotional wellbeing 

• Keeping safe and managing risk 

• Identity, society and equality 

• Sex and relationships (See RSE policy) 

• Drug, alcohol and tobacco education  

• Careers, financial capability and economic wellbeing 

 

2. Statutory requirements 

PSHE is a non-statutory subject. However, there are aspects of it we are required to teach. 

 We teach relationships education under the Children and Social Work Act 2017, in line 
with the terms set out in statutory guidance 

 We teach health education under the same statutory guidance 

This policy also complies with the terms of our multi-academy trust 

 

3. Content and delivery 

3.1 What we teach 

As stated above, we are required to cover the content for relationships and sex education, 
and health education, as set out in the statutory guidance (linked to above).  

Refer to our relationships and sex education policy for details about what we teach, and 
how we decide on what to teach, in this subject. All policies can be accessed via the school 
website.  

3.2 How we teach it 

As a school, we adhere to the following key principles to ensure good quality PSHE. 

PSHE… 
 Is a key, identifiable part of the curriculum, which has planned, timetabled lessons 
including circle time in each year group 

 Works in partnership with parents and carers, informing them about what their children 
will be learning and about how they can contribute at home 

 Has class teachers that deliver lessons where pupils feel safe and encourages 
participation by using a variety of teaching approaches with opportunities to develop 
critical thinking and relationship skills 

 Is based on current reliable sources of information, including about the law and legal 
rights, and distinguishes between fact and opinion 

 Promotes safe, equal, caring and enjoyable relationships and discusses real-life issues 
appropriate to the age and stage of pupils, including relationships, living in the wider 
world and health and well-being 

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2017/16/section/34/enacted
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/relationships-education-relationships-and-sex-education-rse-and-health-education


 Meets the needs of all pupils with their diverse experiences - including those with special 
educational needs and disabilities 

 Seeks pupils’ views so that teaching can be made relevant to their real lives and assessed 
and adapted as their needs change 

 Means that if pupils ask questions outside the scope of the intended objective, teachers 
will respond in an appropriate manner so they are fully informed and don’t seek answers 
online. 

 Means that staff will use the resources provided by the PSHE Association, Kapow PSHE 
alongside any they have created to support the pupils learning 

 

4. Roles and responsibilities 

4.1 The governing board 

The governing board will hold the Headteacher to account for the implementation of this 
policy.  

The governing board has delegated the approval of this policy to Heather Archer. 

4.2 The Headteacher 

The Headteacher is responsible for ensuring that PSHE is taught consistently across the 
school. 

4.3 Staff 

Staff are responsible for: 

 Planning progressive and high quality PSHE lessons 

 Delivering PSHE in a sensitive way  

 Modelling positive attitudes to PSHE  

 Teaching lessons that are not impacted by their personal beliefs and attitudes  

 Monitoring and reporting progress 

 Responding to the needs of individual pupils 

4.4 Pupils 

Pupils are expected to engage fully in PSHE and, when discussing issues related to PSHE, 
treat others with respect and sensitivity. 

 

5. Monitoring arrangements 

The delivery of PSHE is monitored by the PSHE Lead through a range of different forms, 
including reviewing planning, learning walks and pupil voice etc.  

Pupils’ development in PSHE is monitored by class teachers as part of our internal 
assessment systems.  



This policy will be reviewed every 2 years by the PSHE lead. At every review, the policy will 
be approved by the governing board and Headteacher. 

 

6. Coronavirus  

Teaching about hygiene routines, how bacteria and viruses affect health and how to 
recognise ill health, is part of the Health Education aspect of PSHE education at all key 
stages. Pupils may ask about coronavirus (COVID-19) while discussing these topics, or in 
response to media coverage. 

As a staff, we acknowledge that there are times when we need to respond to unforeseen 
events to protect pupils’ wellbeing.  

The topic of coronavirus might create a variety of feelings, including curiosity, anxiety or 
fear. Children and young people can show their distress in a variety of ways (some are less 
obvious than others), so it is important not to make any assumptions about pupils’ feelings 
or reactions. 

As with any PSHE education lesson, it is essential to establish or reinforce ground rules for 
discussion when addressing this topic. 

6. Links with other policies 

This policy links to the following policies and procedures: 

- Relationship and sex education policy 

- Safeguarding/child protection policy  

- Anti-bullying policy 

- Online safety policy 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 
 

 

 



Appendix 1: Curriculum map 


