
Art  Whole School Curriculum 

  Nursery   Reception  Year 1  Year 2  Year 3  Year 4  Year 5  Year 6  

Art  
Autumn 1  

 I can sing a rainbow:  
EAD:  
Colour mixing, paint, 
collage.  
   

Traditional tales  
Do they live happily ever 
after?  
EAD:  
-Painting trolls  
-Learning to use 
tools/techniques  
-Artist: Jackson Pollock  
-Creating a 
Christmas/Birthday 
card  
-Christmas craft  

Drawing  
How are lines and 
shapes used in 
drawings?  

Drawing   
How do we create a 
landscape?   

Drawing  
How do designers use 
drawings?  

Drawing techniques  
Still life  
  

Sculpture   
Art- Maya head pieces   
  
  

Composition   
Still life (sketching & 
watercolours) of fruit  

Art  
Autumn 2  

                

Art  
Spring 1  

Paws, claws and 
whiskers:  
EAD:  
Drawing  
   

Helpful Heroes  
What do you want to be 
when you grow up?   
EAD:  
Colour mixing  
  

Painting  
What are primary and 
secondary colours?  
  

Sculpture  
How are sculptures 
created using natural 
materials?   

Painting  
How can paint be used 
to create different 
effects?  
  

  Drawing  
Portraits of Royalty   

Drawing   
Using detailed sketching 
techniques to create 
realism (portrait)  

Art  
Spring 2  

Mad about Minibeasts  
EAD:  
-Artist: Matisse – The 
Snail  
-Artist: Andy 
Goldsworth natural art  
  

        Painting   
Use varied 
media/materials  
(Delight project).  

     

Art  
Summer 1  

Zoom, zoom, zoom:  
EAD:  
Painting   
   

Journeys  
What journeys do you 
go on?   
EAD:  
Mixed media  
  

Sculpture  
How is clay used to 
create a sculpture?  

Painting  
How do artists use 
complimentary colours 
in paintings?   
  

Sculpture  
How is clay used to 
create 3D models?  

     Sculpture  
Using wire as an 
‘armature’ to support a 
sculpture  

Art  
Summer 2  

Long Long Ago  
Are all fairy tales set in a 
palace?   
EAD:  
Drawings of their 
families  
  

       Paper techniques  
Viking boats  

Painting   
Use varied 
media/materials to 
create shapes, textures, 
patterns and lines  
  
  
  

   

 


